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na and Brazil are bigger votaries of
will continue to pursue local

promote the Indiaa rupee as
an internadonal currenry
and de-risk lndian rrade by
reducing dependence ori one
currency than to deldollar-
ise," the source said.

In tle case of India; more
than half of its total imports
from across countries are in.
voiced in the US dollar,
which is byfar the dominant
ci[Tency for international
trade.

Ertemal Affairs Minister S

Jaishankar and former RBI
Governor Shakrikanta Das,
too, had clarified recestly
that India was not advocat-
ing de-doiiarisation but was

tain countries, such

A,rniti iin'
New Delhi

India is to be'ih the ''-
imrirediate

a lrm-

Brazjl and Shina, who are big long time to fructifu, one of
the focus areas of discussion
at the BRICS Summir in
Kazan in October 2024 was
to foster intra-BRICS trade,
especially iryith iniriatives
like tle BRICS Grain Bx-
change and cross-border
pa)rynent systems in local
currencies. r-

votaries ofreducing
ontle US dollar.

reliahce

'ilf Trump wants to target
BRICS countries for their de-
dollarisation pusir, thg big
promoteis ,zuch as Chin4
Russia and,Brazil are likelvto
be targetedfirst. India's l6cal
currency trade has been lirrr-
ited so far, so the possibility
of being hit by tarihs for it is
lou(' a source tracking t}le
matter told, b usine s sline.

and South Africa as irs core
members, if they conrinue to
pursue their de-dollarisarion
efforts.

?HE PF"NMA!}J!'FORCE
While Russia and China iiave

UAE, and has a rupee pa1-
ment mechanism in piace
with Russia.

Banks from as maay as 22
cor:ntries ha"ve opened spe-
cial rupee vostro accounts in
Indian banks, the MEA had
informed the Lok Sabha in a
written reply in july 2023.

The countries included
Belarus, Botswana, Fiji, Ger-
many, Guyana, Israel, Kenya,
Mhlaysia, Mauritius, Myan-
mar, New Zealand, Oman,
Russia, Seychelles, Singa-
pore, Srl Lanka, Tanzania,
Uganda" Bangladesh, Mal-
dives, Kazakhstan and tie
UnitedKingdom.

action againsr the BRICS
grouping, which includes
Bra:ii., Iiussia Incila, Chjna

While the BRICS nations
have

RUPEEIBADq
However, Lndia is likelv ro
keep pursuing its interesis in
promoting rupee rade with
sor.ne of its uade pdrtners to
help internationalise the In-

'As a BRICS nation. thelrit
face a 100 per cent iari# if
they sc much as even think
about doing whar rhey
thorighg and"therefore they
u'ill give it up immediately,;'
he said.

been aggressively pushing
for de-dollarisation and are
seen as the primary forces
behi$d,the,planned BRICS
cqrreocy, Brazilian Presid-
ent Luiz Inacio Lula da Silva,
too, has been highly critical
of the doliar wstem and has
described it as-an unjust tool
of US dominance that under-
mines the Global South,,

'llndia's -adoption of ,local
currency trade is more to

dian currency and is readv to
face challenges if there were
any,the source said.

'The US government has
been holding discussions mon

recognised that a com-
currency would take a
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