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The Reserve Bank of India 
(RBI) brass, including its 
Governor Sanjay Malhotra, on 
Tuesday told a Parliamentary 
panel that it was “optimistic” 
about the impact of the US tar-
iffs on the Indian economy 
and, in long-run, it could ben-
efit the country due to dipping 
trade relations between the US 
and China. 

The Public Accounts 
Committee (PAC), chaired by 
Congress’ Lok Sabha member 
KC Venugopal, held two meet-
ings on Tuesday, one with top 
RBI officials and the other 
with the Department of 
Financial Services (DFS) and 
managing directors of some of 
the top nationalised banks. 

‘Banking reforms’ was the 
overarching theme of the  
two meetings. 

At the panel’s meeting, 
Governor Malhotra and 
Deputy Governor Rajeshwar 
Rao were present. At the sec-
ond meeting, the 
DFS Secretary 
and MDs of SBI, 
Indian Bank, 
Canara Bank, 
IDBI and Punjab 
National Bank 
were present. 

On tariffs, the 
RBI Governor 
and Deputy 
Governor told the panel that 
the central bank is still 
analysing the impact, but 
their outlook was positive, 
that they do not see any big 
impact on the economy. 

The DFS told the panel that 
the government could bring 
the ‘Banning of Unregulated 
Lending Activities Bill’ in the 
next session of Parliament, to 
check public lending by indi-
viduals or organisations that 

are neither regis-
tered under any 
law, nor  
authorised by 
the RBI or other 
regulators. 

Panel mem-
bers also wanted 
to know why the 
DFS had 
approved an 

infusion of ~8,000 crore into 
the State Bank of India in 
2018 as part of its recapitali-
sation exercise without the 
country’s biggest lender ask-
ing for such funds. 

A Comptroller and Auditor 
General (CAG) report present-
ed in Parliament in 2023 had 
also flagged the issue. 

The panel, which has 22 
members, sought to know 
from the DFS and MDs of 
nationalised banks about the 
paucity of banks in naxal-
affected areas and north east-
ern states. The government 
and banks said these areas will 
also have a bank branch within 
five kilometres within a year. 

On non-performing assets, 
the panel was told that it is 
declining. The panel said 
defaulters should be cate-
gorised, an early warning sys-
tem put in place for bigger 
defaulters, and banks should 
have an entrepreneurial 
mind-set and not a bureau-
cratic one.

The DFS informed 
the panel that the 
govt could bring 
the Banning of 
Unregulated 
Lending Activities 
Bill in the next 
Parliament session 


