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The International Monetary
Fund on Thursday said In-
dia-s economic growh is ex-
pected to recover kom its re.
ceilt moderation, In/ith

infl ation se! to decline. i:Iow-
ever, thg IMF also cautioned
that domestic deraand maY
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'rGror,rlth is expected to ac"

celerate in the second haHof
thefiscal
catch-up

closed," said an IMF report
prepared on the basis of 2024
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India. The report came a day
before the ofSci*l a::uounce-
ment of growth;lfnbers for
the. October-December
qua{ter (Q3) of FY25.
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Further, the repo.rt said in
the next fiscal, robust do-
mestjc dersacd is elpqcted
to sustain growth at 6.5 per
cent. Over the medii$n term,
grov/rh is projected to con-
tinue aligningwith its poten-
rial rr 6.5 per cent. "Infladon
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in trading partners will con:
rain export gro',rrth, with ser-
vices export$ outpacing mer-
chandise trade. The picbuP
in domestic consumPtion
and investment will zupPott
imporcs. Net FDI hai de-
cliied to almost zero, with
repatriation and ourward in-
vesrments offsetting steadY
gross inflows.
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conver- lionin
said it remained above the

account deficit is
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