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Minister Nirmala
on Tuesday said
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ing and investment accounts

as well as cloud servers, in
search,and seizure cases.

As per the Bill, virrual di-
gital space encompasses aoy
digital realm that allom
users to interact, commuhic.
ate and perform activities us-
ing computer .slstems, coE:
puter networks. ,and
communication deviees, and
includes eriail servers, social
media accounts; ouline in-
vestment aceourts, rrading
accounts, banking accounts,
etc; any website used for
storing details of orrnership
of any asseg remote seryer or
cloud servers; and digital ap
plicationplatforms.

BErIERCOMPLTANCE
Talking about comptance,
she said more than 3Q000
taxpayers revised their I-T
returns or filed belated re-
turhs aud deplared addi-
tional fcreig-c rssets and ill-
come ofabout {30,300 crore.

"\tre carried outia tudsd
campaign in which we
nudged taxpayers to volun-
tarily'disclose their foreign
income and assets," she said,

As a result of the pam-
paign, she Said out of 19,501
taipayers, a total of 11,162
taxpayers revised thek re-
tunis and filledout Schedule
Foreign Assets Form, declar-
ing total assets of <11 ;259.29
crore and disclosing foreign
income of t15,t .42 crore.
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