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High visibility of stmctural
demand and healthier cor-
porate and bank balance-
sheets can be the galvanising
forces for economic growth
going forward, according to
the RBI Mont}ly Bulletin. It
underscored that India's real
GDP growth was at a six-
quarter high in the hird
quarter.of FY24, powered by
strong demand momeatum,
robust indirect taxes, and
lower subsidies.

However, priv-ate final
consumption e><penditure
remained lour, despite the
third quarter coinciding with
the festiral season, accord-
ing to an article t:tled. State of
the Econom4t, authored by
RBI officials, including
Deputy Governor MD Patra-
Even the government's final
consumption contracted
durtrgthe quarter.
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