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Adani Green has witldrawn
from a controversiai $442-
million renewable'energY-
proiect in northern Sri Lanka
amid frerce loca! oppcsition
and a legal trattle over its aP.

provai and potential envil-
onmental impact.

The coropany's with-
drawatr from the big-ticket
renewabie energy pro.iect in
Sri Lanka signals a signific-
ant retreat, given tie A<iani

Group's investment push in
India's neighbourhood in re-
cent )ears.

The move also amounts to
a win for Sri Lanka's Presid-
ent Anura Kuinara Dis-
sanayake, who, ahead ofhis
election in September 2024,
vowed to cancel the "cor-
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meflt, seea by The lttndu,
Adani Green said foilowing
the Sri Lalkan governrnent's
receBt decision to renegoti-
ate the project, it decided to
"respectfi.r-lly withdraw from
the said proj ect", while'ful lY

respectinf' the sovereiSn
rights of Sri Lanka and its
choices,

sl-SrD"y,roNPRoJECT'
Citing'lrotracted discus-
sions" with the Cevlon Elec-
triciw Board for'over tv*o
o"*u'on the 484 lr{W vrind
iarms tobe setup inMannar
and Poonerla towns in
nonhern Sri Lanka, the com-
p?rry said it had envisaged a

iotal inresrment - includ-
ing in linked rransmission
ne"tworks - of nearlv $1bil-
lion for the 'build-oiati-oper-
ate'oroiect.

,chani Green's wind farm
project in nonhem Sri Lai*a
has remained contentious
from the time it was ap
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cessor Wickremesinghe ad-

mini$ration took the project
ahead, despite serious con-
cems raised by the Political
opposition over the aPPareat
lack of due process and
ffansparencv.

naannar residents arrd act-
ivists aiso opposed the Pro-
jea, flagging potentiai dam-
aee to a key aviation corridor,
ainong othe. environmentai
risks,- and challenged the
project rn Sri Lanka's Su-
premeCowt;
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In a media. .statement oR

Thursday, an Adaoi sPokes-
person said: "Ada-ai Green
Ln.rgy has conveYed its
board's decision to r€si?ect-
fu]lv withdraw from further
.ngugu**rrt in the Rg widd
enE.$y- p.olect and tw-o

transmission projects ia Sri,
Lanka, However, we remain
committed to Sri Lanka nnd
are open to future collabora-
tion if ttre government of Sri
Lanka so desires.'l Coiombo
is yet to commQnt oP the
development.

The Adani Group is, how;
ever, golag ahead-with thb
cons'Lruction of the $700-
million West Container Ter-
minal at the Coiombo port,
parnrerlng with the Sri
Lanka Fsrcs Arithority end
conglomerate John Keelis
Holdings. 'prorred
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rupt" project. Months into
office, however, his govern-
ment appeared wiitrirg to
renegotiate it,

202,4. pPA
In january, the Dissana]€.ke
administration decided to
revoke a 2024 power pur-
chase agreement -- cleared
by the predecessor Ranil
Wickremesinghe govem-
ment ; try widch Sri Lanka
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or 8.26 cents,
froie Ada*i Green,


