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Hpndai Motor india Ltd
(HMIL), in its first quanerly
financial report since going
public iast month, revealed
the chailenges it faced in a

weakening domestic market
and rising g1oba1 geopolitical
tenslons.

The South Korean auto-
maker reported a 15.5 Per
cent drop in prof,t after tax
(PAT) in the second quarter
and a 3 per cent decline for
the first half of FY25, reffect-
ing the pressures of softer
domestic demand and global
uncertainties.

For the quarter ended
September 30, Htr{ILrs PAT
stood at t1,375.5 crore,
dornm from t1,628.5 crore in
the same period last year,
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Domestic sales fe11 5.8 per
cent to 1,49,639 units while
er?orts dropped 17.1 per
cent to 42,300 units due to
the disruptions in M/est Asia.

For H1, PAT ra,as t2,865.1
crore (t2,957.7 crore in H1
FY24) rvith revenue slipping
1.9 per cent to <34,604.6
crore. However, Hl EBITDA
increased to t4,545.6 crore,
raising the margln to 13.14
per cent;

Managing Director Unsoc
Kim stated that despite the
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challenging cbnditions, the
company maintained proflt-
abiliqv through stringent
cost controls. He pointed to
the upcoming Creta EV, ex-

pected to be launched in Q4,
as a game-changer for the
electric vehicle ma-rket. The
neu'Chennai piant, slated to
begrn production in Q3
FY26, will bolster iocalisa-
tion and enhance EV com-
petitiveness. HMIIIs SL.IV

iales continued their uprvard
trend, accounting for 68 per

' j :r-l -i. l

1{

2wet
cent of total volumes in H1,
up from 61 per cent lastyear'

The share of hatchbacks
and sedans in overali sales

declined to 20 per cent
(doum from 24 per cent) and
i2 per cent (down from 16

per ceni) respecrively.

BLIMPY ROAD A}ItrAD
Lookilg ahead, *re ma$age-
meot ex?ects low single-di-
g'it growth to continue in the
near tenn, impacted by geo-
political issues. high interest
rates and ffucnrating de-
mand.

Hov;ever, HMIL remains,
optirnistic, citing. a,30 per
cent yeaJ-on-year lncrease ln
October sales, signaliing re-

, silience within the industry
The company anticipates

this moderate growth trend
wiil carry through the second
half of the,vear.
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