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BH\TS ,}rybrid
wouldbe lYfong'

to get us to net zero. So, if at
alJ those are rhe priorities,
then we have to pursue elec
tric mobility," Sinla said.
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emissions by 2ATA,
vehicle rypes require
definitions, he added.

Batteiy electric vehicles
(BEVs) and hybrid vehicles
are fu-ndamenraily different
and thus cannot be incentiv-
ised at t}e same ievel, a
senior official at Niti Aayog
stated on'I'hursday.

To position Iodia as a
gigbai EV manufacturing
hub and achieve net-zero

iedged tirat hytrid vehicies
are wetrcome, which is why
they do not incw Corporate
Average Fuel Economy
(CAFE) penalties. IIowever,
he stressed that govemfirent
suppor-t shouJd primarily be
directed towards BE!'s. Eey-
o.nd !fv.s, Sinha suggesrdd
that hydrogen vehicies or
Fuel Celi Elecrric Vehicles
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Despite this, Sir:ha ackro-x-

both
cldar
Sud-

hendu Jyoti Sinha, Advisor at
Niti Aayog, told businessline,
"The1r (EVs) have zero oper-
ational emissions; absoluteiy
nothing. Hybrids, on the
other hand, do have emis-

(FCEVE are aaorher tech$o-
ioey India should adopt
quickly, as tley can be com-
pared with battery-etrectrie
technology.

When questloned about
the end-of-lifecycle manage-
ment for BEVs, given the
hazardous narure of lithium-
ion batteries if not disposed
of responsibly, Sinha- con-
firmed thar Niti AavoE anC
the Mini srry of Snvir'onlnent
have collaborated to creale

sions, albeit lower:ones. So,
comparing hybrids and bat-
tery EVs would be wrong.,,
'He explained thar while

hltrid vehicie$ urilise fuel-
efficient technology, this will
neitlrer significantly reduce
nor ellmmale the counftfs
reliance on. fuel imporis.
"That is not going to com-
pletely clean up the envjron-

'battery w?ste fiIoooE€rrrei r r

rules'. :'There is a ve[, well-
set protocol on how tlie bat-ment or afmosphere from

poliution- airQuility. fhat is
notwhat is gdingto make In-
clia the EV manufacturing
hub, and thatwill notbe abl6
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