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ilda's ccpper dcnand ia-
c;eased b]' 13 per ceht 1'ear-
oir-r'ear in the 2t:23-2C24
fiscal, tcir"rchir'g 1.7 iniliiol
tolnes (lnt), sa4s a sa:d.-v o;r
airnual ccppei demard uii-
deraken b\: tlie kitema-
tional Coppei Associatioir
India (ICAI). The grov,.rh has
been attributed to oi'erall
economic eriransicn.

According to the srrrdl', a
notabie feature of tle
grori.rh il demarrd ior ccpper
is ttrat posr-pandemic -rlie a.,,-

erage arnual demarrd in-
creased by 21 per cent
ben,,een 2020-2027 and
2023-2024.

A statement ftom ICAI
said strong den.ia:rd froi:i the
constirctiorr and infrastruc-
ftlrc sec[or.s continuei to
drive copper de*rand ir: in-
dia.

Trariitioriall-v, the con-
structior anri infrastnLcture
secioi-s accomt for 43 per
celt of the copper Cenai:C
1.l-rile colrtr:ibutirg 1.1 per
c.rt to tle GIIP.

FI,AT $LN'P'IJT GRO1YTII
The Cc:nestic pr+Cuctiol ci
corpe:: cathoCes rose 
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per cenl ald net irr,pcns oi
varioLrs forrrs of coppei il-
crerisedby 13 per cent durhg
the sa-vre period.

Irtlai.rir Karmarkar, l*ia:r-
aging Dire:tol; Literrratio$al
Copper Associaticn India",
said, "Tl:e (copper demanii)
gro\lth is i.relled b"y pubiic
anC private sector iri'"€st-
rrlents, higher consiimer
spending and adr.aaceinents
in ke-_v sectois like consnrc-
tion, irfrastruclure, trans-
pcr'Lation: ildustrial and
consumer goods v,.llereirr
copper Cemand grerv b,t
double-digits."

Ir"li'le deme-rd has in-
creaseC, the gro**Lh in In
ciia's domestic ref,ned cop-
per proiiuction has iargelv
remaine<i fiat for manv years

iue to the closure of Ved-
a:rta's Tuticorin smelter.

annual copper demand rose
by 2i% between 2020-2421
and2A23-2424

with only Hindaico's
smelter operating, domestic
cathode production fell by 7
per celrt in 2023-2424,
mainly ciue to major plant
malntenance in first quaner
of the fiscal. Net cathode irrt-
ports grewby 103 per cent in
{{24.

EISE IN SC&AP SLIPFI.Y
IC/J said India generated
.1.68,000 tonaes of end-of:
iife and process copper aad
ailo,v scrap, which was fur-
ther suppleoenred by the
net iaports of an adCitional
1,92,000 tonnes of copper
ar:rl allc,r, scrap during tle
fiscal. The overall secondary
srrap supply incree.sed by 15
pef cel]t.

Currentl,v, India primari ly
relies on the direct melticg
of scr:ap, resulting in variable
copper puritl due to the usr
of di\.er"se scrap q?es.

The direct remelting of
copper in semi-fabricatlon
units raises quaiity concerns,
especially regarding tramp
eler:-rents (eiemerrs that
ca.nnr.rr be remo-ved easily s
the direct remeltlng process)
in electrical conductivity
applicaticns.

QUT1LITYISSUES
The implementation of the
qualiry ccntrol order (QCO)
fbr copper products is expec-
ted to address the quaiiry is-
sues in the longrunbvensur-
Lng tlnt copper used ir India
adheres to sii"ict standards,
said the ICAJ Managing
l)irector.
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