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'Iffith more

offerings. T1re expo, brgan-
ised by the Society of Indian
Automobile, Manufacnuers
(SI&M), vil4i be,, ,held
duriag Janrarj, 17:22, 2025,
in]ilewDelhi.

To]'ota Kirl0sk6r Motor, Hy-
undai Motor India and Ki*
Motors India are expected to
showcase their latest moriels
and technological innova-

fhe expo will also see ia:
ternauonal brasds such as
EMW, Mercedes, Skoda and
Porsche making thgir pres-
ence felt, along wittr electric
vehicle (EV) pioneers such
as Ather Energy, Ola Electrie
andtr4nfast.

TIIRSE VE3&IES :,,
The Auto Expo is just one
element of the larger Bharat
Mob,ility Giobal E;po 2025,
an egpansive event,-5pread

' acro$s tlree venues: Bhslat
Mandapano, r*hobhoomi in

' Dwarla an-d I*di.a@o }fIart
i-n CreaterNoida-

-,:1:!j:>, ;._..:l+;!-
;,.:: e*

but also

the direetion

{

g

of safe,

and a foc'ils
l"uto


