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Prince of Dubai 5heikh
Ai Maktourn inNewDelhi pn ,

ingonMonday.
[ndia and the UAE signed a

compreheflsive economic
parn:ership agreement in
2022, boosang aade and in-
vestrnent :relations. The
countries elevated their ties
to a corhprehertsive strate$0
partnership' ' following
Modi's visit to the UAE in
August2015.

ttre Deputy Prime Minister
ofthe UAE and also holds the
defence pordolio.

"Glad to meet HH Sheikh
Hamdan bin Mohammed bin
Rashid ,{l ,Makouu, the
Crown Prince of Dubai.
Dubai has played a key role in
advancing the India-UA-E
Comprehensive S*ategic
Partnership. This special
visit. reaffirms our deep-
rooted friendship and paves
ths \eray for even stronger
collaborarion in rhe fufure "
naodi posteJ on r".irl ;;i,
platfonu 'X after the meet-
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Minister said.
He alsc said t}at both In-

dia and the UAE are commit-
ted to n'orking towards
peace and prosperity in the
region. 
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