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with rate cuts, it ease

RBI more roorn
irit the sell
mestie
amiCst a
markets.
bani<s

ing cues from the depreciat-
ing tl'end in the non-deliver-

able forward (IttrIlF) market"
Anind lfunagasabai, Exec-

utive Vice-President (Treas-
ury), Tamilnad l4ercantile
Bank, said.: 

(IATheneyer 
tlrere

is a lmge crash in tle market,
money,wiil go out by way of
FPI ourfiov;s. "A1l export-

oriented companies shares
have falien today. l4Ihat this
indicates is that there will be
shortfall in dollar inffows
even as imports rvlll con-
tinue.

"So, overall trade deficit
will widen. Market players

tiona.l rate reCuetions.
Sonal Badha-a, Econondst,

Eank of Baroda, observed
. that the current year is likclrv
to be marlled bi, a perioo of
volatillt.y on tire currency
front, arauiting eiariry on US
tariff policies. This wili also
set the stage for the Fed's
rete actionsr ir! truu aftectiirg
hou thc doilar beii;ves.

ilc tiie don:estic &'ont, m-
pe: is lik;11 to iind suppor.
fi'om imprc.. ement in
gro$/ti} prospects, iom'er in-
ff.ation and stable exterrrai
deficiis.

Oi'erall. BoB's econoinics
department expects ttre ru-
pee to traCe in the range of
85.5-8'7"5 in FY26.
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Hence,
FIe obseneei that US im-

poners v,ill re-r,egoriate ex-
rort contracts

dollar
&om

r pressure
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