
VinFast rolls out assembly 
unit for EVs in Thoothukudi 
Plant to see investment of up to ~16K cr; ~4,300 cr to be used in 1st phase 
shine jacob 
Chennai, 4 August 

Vietnamese electric vehicle 
major VinFast on Monday offi-
cially inaugurated its electric 
vehicle (EV) assembly plant at 
Thoothukudi in Tamil Nadu. 
The unit is set to see an invest-
ment to the tune of ~16,000 
crore in phases, of which ~4,300 
crore will be used in the  
first phase. 

The plant was inaugurated 
by Tamil Nadu Chief Minister M 
K Stalin. VinFast Tamil Nadu is 
the company’s third operational 
plant and the fifth project in its 
global manufacturing network. 
The company is planning to 
develop Thoothukudi as an 
export hub, as “EV capital of 
South Asia”, said a top executive. 

Stalin said that the facility 
was built in a record time of 17 
months from the date of ground-
breaking ceremony. 

“The VinFast Tamil Nadu 
plant marks a strategic mile-
stone in our long-term commit-
ment to the Indian market. It 
establishes a strong foundation 
for sustainable growth and posi-
tions us to offer high-quality, 
competitively priced electric 
vehicles to Indian consumers,” 
said Pham Sanh Chau, chief 
executive officer of VinFast Asia. 

In its initial phase, VinFast 
Tamil Nadu will focus on assem-

bling two premium electric SUV 
models — VF 7 and VF 6. The 
plant’s starting capacity is 
50,000 vehicles per year, scal-
able up to 150,000 units 
annually to meet the rising 
market demand. 

 The company has reportedly 
scouted 15 locations in six Indian 
states before choosing Tamil 
Nadu. “This investment will 
lead to an entirely new industrial 
cluster in south Tamil Nadu, and 
more clusters are what India 
needs to emerge as a global 
manufacturing hub," said state 
industries minister TRB Rajaa. 

As the first VinFast facility 

inaugurated outside Vietnam, it 
demonstrates both the brand’s 
global vision and its capacity to 
deliver large-scale projects.  

With a total area of 400 
acres, the plant is equipped 
with state-of-the-art produc-
tion lines meeting world-class 
standards, featuring advanced 
automation and cutting-edge 
technologies. The complex 
houses multiple workshops, 
including body shop, paint 
shop, assembly shop, quality 
control centre, and a logistics 
hub. It also includes an auxili-
ary cluster for local contractors, 
which is expected to expand in 

the coming years. 
At full capacity, the plant will 

create 3,000-3,500 direct jobs for 
local workers, along with thou-
sands of indirect jobs in the 
supply chain ecosystem. This 
will help boost socioeconomic 
development in Tamil Nadu, 
positioning the state as a manu-
facturing hub for India and a 
potential EV capital of South 
Asia in the near future. 

With the launch of the Tamil 
Nadu plant, VinFast moves 
closer to its 2025 sales target of 
200,000 vehicles and its long-
term production goal of 1 million 
vehicles per year by 2030. This 
milestone reaffirms VinFast’s 
commitment to promoting sus-
tainable mobility and advancing 
a greener future in India and 
worldwide, it said. 

 “Looking ahead, the facility 
will expand its production 
capacity to meet rising demand. 
We aim to develop it into Vin-
Fast’s largest export hub for 
South Asia, the West Asia, and 
Africa. In fact, we’ve already 
secured initial orders from sev-
eral countries across these 
regions. In close collaboration 
with the Tamil Nadu govern-
ment, VinFast is working to 
transform the area into the 'EV 
capital of South Asia'— suppor-
ting both the dynamic domestic 
market and our broader regional 
ambitions,” Chau added. 
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