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The parameter ofsuccess for
the consumer durabies in-
dustry wordd be its success
in exporting to counries
s"ith whicir it has collabora-
tions, like Japan a:id otler
developcd narions, though it
already has a strcrg f6ct-
pnnt in .{fCca lad dre
Middie-Easg A_mardeep
Singh Bhatia, Secrera-ry, De-
parlment for Promotion of
Industry and Inreraal Trade
(DPIIT), has said"

"To achieve that industry
musr ensurc qualiry su1
ahead in terms oitectrnology
and. increase spend on
R&D," Bhada said in his ad.
dress at ttIe Consumer Elec-
tronics & Durables Summit
organised by indusrry body
Cll. The indusrry should fo-
cus on exporrs and future
demand wirile plalrning in-
vestments or joint trcntures

drirables sector is on
a strong growth patil
supponed by
liberalised
investments, a

land availability and clear-
ances, there's immense oo-
tentiaj for rhe indus6,^ 16
caprure both domesric'and
global markets,,, Bhatia sajd. .

ONPLISCHEME
Srressing on the imponance
of the governrnent'i produc-
rion Linled tncenrive (pli)
scheme for the industry, B
?hiagaraian, Chairmani Ctt
Iiarional Co,iln:itee on

i: i''

lndia's consumer

se€r€tary, DPIiT

for expanding production,
the Secretarysaid.

He cited the examoles of
other countries like'Ttail-
and and China where the fe
cus was largel,v on e4ports.

The consumer durables
industry is prdjected ro
reach the size of approxim-
ately tS-lakh crore and will
create around 5 lalJr skilied

Consrieer Elgctronics and
Durables,. stated that exten-
sion of the scheue from end
products to components
was helping in fosiering a
competitive manufacfuring
ecosystemi[India- '

"This, in turrL is attract-
ing global inwstaoenB and
positioniag our natiou as a
global manufacturiog hub,'
Ihe oppomrnities &eated
ifuough the PLI scheme are
ueoendous, and I am con-
fident they tyill olav a vltal
role in sha]1ingtfie future of
ourindusuy;"he sald.

jobs across the lalue chain
.by 2A3A, according ro a CII
report.

"India's consumer dur-
ables sector is on a strong
growth path, supported by
liberalised investments, a
thriving san-up ecosystem,
innolztion anC R&D. With
industry corridors and in-
dustria! parks streamliaing
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