
Ta[tlo to overhaul product
platfonns to reduce costs
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AIMING TO CUT costs through
economies of scale, Tata Motors
will replace its existing product
platforms with modern and
lightweight architecture. This
will result in a consolidation of
platforms and improve produc-
tion efficiencies,

Followingthe launch of the
Avinya in 202 6,Tata Motorswill
have around six platforms,
including a couple of derirratives
of older platforms. It may come
down to 2-3 platforms overthe
next fewyears. Shailesh Chan-
dra, managing director, Tata
Motors Passenger Vehicles and
Tata PassengerElectric Mobility,
observed that the multiple plat-
forms "have to transition and
converge to one platform for a
certain set of products".

Some of the company's older
nameplates like Nexon, Tiago
and Tigor run on the X1 plat-
form,whichwas used forthe Iast
edition of the Indica, Tata
Motors' first passenger. car
brand,before itwas phased out.
These products will undergo
theirlife cyde ctunge scheduled
in acouple ofyears."Inthe next
five years,youwill see that con-
vergence starting to happen as

TFIE ROAD AHEAD
I First product under the
premium category of
Avinya brand scheduled for
launch in 2026

uThiswill
include a few
derivatives
of older
platforms

rThis maycome
downto 2-5
platforms over next
few years

the product life cyde goes forthe
next intervention for individual
productsi Chandra told analysts
at the recent annual Investor
DayeventinMumbai.

Tata Motors'newerproducts
like the Curwand the upcom-
ing Sierra are based on a modu-
larplatform calledATI,AS (adap-

tive tech-forward lifestyle
architecture). The SUV-oirty
ATLAS platform has allowed
Tata Motors the flexibility to
have both electric and non-elec-
tric options onthe models.

The relatively newer prod-
ucts like the Altroz and the
Punch are based onAlfa andAlfa

Arc platforms. The company is
investing in the AIfa architec-
ture for future products. Its
larger models - Harrier and
Safari - are based on aplatform
called Omega,which is essen-
tially a derivative of Land
Rovef s D8 architecture.

"We are investing inA1ha for
lightweighting and strengthen-
ing of the body stgucture. We
have Omega doing Harrierand
Safari. There might be a third
platform but you will see con-
solidation of platforms and a
very modem platform in wttich
we will be investing for light
weightingi Chandra ddded.
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